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Merland Rise
Tadworth

Offers Over £375,000

• No Onward Chain
• End of Terrace Family

Home
• Three Bedrooms
• Lounge through dinning

area
• Off Street Parking
• Local amenities
• Close to Tadworth and

Tattenham Corner Train
station

• Easy access to M25

Johnson’s are delighted to offer to the
market this spacious 3-bedroom end of
terrace family home within walking
distance of local shops and both
Tadworth and Tattenham Corner
railway stations with NO ON WARD
CHAIN. The accommodation briefly
compromises to the ground floor an
entrance porch that leads onto the
hallway, living room through dinning
area and a kitchen that leads onto the
back garden. Upstairs compromises 2
double bedrooms, a single 3rd bedroom
all with built in wardrobes, a family
bathroom and a separate toilet. Outside
to the front there is off street parking
with side access to the garden, and to
the rear is a good size garden mainly
laid to lawn with a large patio area.
This property is in need of updating and
modernising but a definite must see to
appreciate the full potential. This
property also has potential to extend all
STPP. Tadworth village caters for day-
to-day needs with local amenities and
there are larger shopping facilities close
by at Epsom, Sutton, and Kingston.
Epsom Downs.



the  layout

How energy
efficient is the

property?
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Mail: johnsons@johnsons-ipa.co.uk Web: www.johnsons-ipa.co.uk
Addr: Johnson's IPA, Station House, Bunbury Way, Epsom, KT17 4JP

Sales: 01372 721722 Lettings: 01372 878545
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